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Esther Salmon <esther@retirement.capital>

FW: Invoice
1 message

Greg Walters <greg@chamberlaingrp.co.uk> 15 January 2024 at 11:47
To: Esther Salmon <esther@retirement.capital>

Hi Esther

 

Please see below VAT reg and attached utility bill.

 

Please confirm safe receipt and that all is in order.

 

Regards

 

 

Greg​​​​ Walters
Director

T:  +44 (0)121 737 9258
M: +44 (0)7968 070162
E:  greg@chamberlaingrp.co.uk
W: www.chamberlainpropertycompany.com
A: 7 Bella Pais Barns, Aldridge, West Midlands, WS9 0PZ

​
​

This email and the information it contains may be privileged and/or confidential. It is for the intended addressee(s) only. 

​The unauthorised use, disclosure or copying of thsemail, or any information it contains is prohibited and could incertaincircumstances 

​be a criminal offence. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and  delete the message from your system.

​Please note that Chamberlain Property Company does not enter into any form of contract by means of Internet email. 

​None of the staff of Chamberlain Property Company are authorised to enter into contracts on behalf of the company in this way. 

​All contracts to which Chamberlain Property Company is party are documented by other means.

​Chamberlain Property Company monitors emails to ensure its systems operate effectively and to minimise the risk of viruses. 

​Whilst it has taken reasonable steps to scan this email, it does not accept liability for any virus that it may contain. 

​Chamberlain Capital Limited is a seperate legal entity to Chamberlain Property Company and is a broker of non regulated loans 

​to companies and private individuals and is not a lender. 

​Chamberlain Capital Limited is a limited company registered in England & Wales Registration no: 14443439. 
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​Information Commissioners Office Reg No: ZB518503. 

​Chamberlain Capital Limited is a member of the Financial Intermediary & Broker Association (FIBA). Our membership Number is FIB41092.

 

From: Antony Bailey <antonyabelec@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, January 15, 2024 10:46 AM
To: Greg Walters <greg@chamberlaingrp.co.uk>
Subject: Re: Invoice

 

Hi Greg,

I can confirm my VAT registration number is 620270388.

Utility bill attached as requested.

Please note our trading address is The Croft, 10A New Street, Barlestone, Nuneaton, Warwickshire, CV130EA. Our
registered address is 3 High Street, Ibstock, Leicestershire, LE67 6LG.

 

Kind regards,

Antony Bailey
Director

AB Security & Electrical LTD

M: +447712 676675

A: 10A New Street, Barlestone

CV13 0EA

W: https://www.absecurityelectrical.co.uk/

E: antonyabelec@gmail.com

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. It is strictly forbidden
to share any part of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender. If you
received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that
we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future.

 

 

On Mon, Jan 15, 2024 at 9:57 AM Greg Walters <greg@chamberlaingrp.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Antony

 

Retirement Capital have asked for 2 more things:-

 

your VAT registration number
Utility Bill for your home address with your name on dated within the last 3 months.

 

Would you kindly send that over to me by email please?
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