
Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com>

Fwd: LEI Request Complete: BRISTOLPAD PENSION SCHEME - LEI:
213800LU6SNJ2OASSI64

Gavin <gavinm@pensionpractitioner.com> 27 July 2020 at 14:26
To: Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com>

Pension Practitioner

T:  0800 634 4862 
F:  020 8906 6611

Administration Centre: Venture Wales, Pentrebach. Merthyr Tydfil. CF48 4DR
Pension Practitioner is a tradestyle of The Practitioners Partnership LP
Registered Number: 00159
Registered Office: 1st Floor, World Trade Centre, Baytree Road, Gibraltar GX11 1AA

IMPORTANT - PLEASE NOTE The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is
addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or
other use of or taking of any action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended
recipient is prohibited. If you received this in error please contact the sender and destroy this email.

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <LEI@lseg.com>
Date: Mon, 27 Jul 2020 at 14:26
Subject: LEI Request Complete: BRISTOLPAD PENSION SCHEME - LEI: 213800LU6SNJ2OASSI64
To: <gavinm@pensionpractitioner.com>

Invoice Number: 203816
Customer Code:
Service: UNAVISTA LEI
Page 1 of 1

gavin mccloskey
pension practitioner
48 chorley new road
bolton
United Kingdom
bl1 4ap

Invoice Date: 27/07/2020
Tax Point Currency: GBP
From: 28/07/2020
To: 27/07/2021
Customer VAT Number: VAT Exempt

Description Units Charge/Unit Net Amount VAT%

LEI: 213800LU6SNJ2OASSI64
Official Entity Name:
BRISTOLPAD PENSION
SCHEME
Annual Renewal Date:
27/07/2021 1 90.00 90.00 20.00
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Payment Reference:
LEIN35244202007241048058537
(including LEI Licence Fee)
1 x £90.00

VAT Summary and Totals

Invoice Values for UK
VAT Purposes Only
NET GBP:
VAT @20.00%: TOTAL
GBP:

90.00
18.00

108.00

Net Total:
VAT Total: Gross Total Due:
Pre-Payment received
with thanks:
Payment method:

90.00
18.00

108.00

108.00
Credit Card

London Stock Exchange LEI Limited
Registered Office: 10 Paternoster Square London EC4M 7LS
Registration No: 08530763
Tax Registration:GB524922449

www.londonstockexchange.com

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Please read these warnings and restricƟons:

This e‐mail transmission is strictly confidenƟal and intended solely for the ordinary user of the e‐mail address to which it was
addressed. It may contain legally privileged and/or CONFIDENTIAL informaƟon.

The unauthorised use, disclosure, distribuƟon and/or copying of this e‐mail or any informaƟon it contains is prohibited and
could, in certain circumstances, consƟtute a criminal offence.

If you have received this e‐mail in error or are not an intended recipient please inform London Stock Exchange Group
(“LSEG”) immediately by return e‐mail or telephone 020 7797 1000.

LSEG may collect, process and retain your personal informaƟon for its business purposes. For more informaƟon please see
our Privacy Policy.

We advise that in keeping with good compuƟng pracƟce the recipient of this e‐mail should ensure that it is virus free. We do
not accept responsibility for any virus that may be transferred by way of this e‐mail.

E‐mail may be suscepƟble to data corrupƟon, intercepƟon and unauthorised amendment, and we do not accept liability for
any such corrupƟon, intercepƟon or amendment or any consequences thereof.

Calls to London Stock Exchange Group may be recorded to enable LSEG to carry out its regulatory responsibiliƟes.

London Stock Exchange Group plc

10 Paternoster Square
London
EC4M 7LS

Registered in England and Wales No 05369106

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
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