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Lisa Welton <lisa@retirement.capital>

Re: Scottish Widows [CT-1259383]
1 message

Lisa Welton <lisa@retirement.capital> 12 October 2023 at 12:10
To: Simon Pryce <simon@skylightmedia.co.uk>
Cc: $RetirementClaims <RetirementClaims@scottishwidows.co.uk>, Veronica Walkman <veronica@retirement.capital>

Please find attached HMRC Screenshots dated today. Confirming 

Open Status, 
Scheme Details, 
Membership details. 

On Thu, 12 Oct 2023 at 12:03, Simon Pryce <simon@skylightmedia.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Carolyn,

Thank you for that.

Odd,I already sent that proof with the last pack of documents you received.

Let me dig it out and resend it.

Kind regards,

Simon

Simon Pryce MBA CMgr FCMI
Director
Skylight Media
0115 958 6060 or 07970 504 293

Sent from my mobile, so please forgive any typos!

On Thu, Oct 12, 2023, 10:59 $RetirementClaims <RetirementClaims@scottishwidows.co.uk> wrote:
Classification: Confidential

A logo with black text Description automatically generated

If you are having any trouble viewing attachments that should be on this email please ensure this email
is opening in Adobe Reader and not in an internet browser.

 

 

Good Morning Mr Pryce,

 

Scottish Widows Transfer request

 

 

Thank you for sending over the details of your money helper appointment. I have passed this onto the business
area who are responsible for doing our checks before we process claims.
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They have advised that we are still waiting for proof dated within the last 30 days that the receiving scheme is
registered with HMRC (This can be a screenshot from the HMRC portal).

 

Kind Regards

 

Carolyn

 

Carolyn Shearer (She/Her)

 

Claims Administrator

Insurance & Wealth Customer Delivery

 

INSURANCE, PENSIONS & INVESTMENTS CHIEF OPERATING OFFICE (IP&ICOO)

A: 69 Morrison Street, Edinburgh, EH3 1HL     E: RetirementClaims@scottishwidows.co.uk

 

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail or its attachments

 

  

 

 

 

This E-Mail is confidential. Unauthorised recipients must notify the sender immediately on 0131-655-6789 and
must delete the original E-Mail without taking a copy. We virus scan and monitor all e-mails but are not
responsible for any damage caused by a virus or alteration of our email by a third party after transmission. The E-
Mail is not intended nor should it be taken to create any legal relations, contractual or otherwise.

Scottish Widows Limited is registered in England and Wales No. 3196171. Registered office in the United
Kingdom at 25 Gresham Street, London EC2V 7HN. Authorised by the Prudential Regulation Authority and
regulated by the Financial Conduct Authority and the Prudential Regulation Authority. Financial Services Register
number 181655. Scottish Widows Unit Trust Managers Limited, Co No. 1629925/Financial Services Register No.
122129, Registered Office at Charlton Place, Andover, Hampshire SP10 1RE and Scottish Widows
Administration Services Limited, Co No. 1132760/Financial Services Register No. 139398, Registered Office at
25 Gresham Street, London, EC2V 7HN are Registered in England and Wales. Both are authorised and
regulated by the Financial Conduct Authority.

Scottish Widows Services Limited, Co No.SC189975 is registered in Scotland, Registered Office at 69 Morrison
Street, Edinburgh, EH3 8YF

*** WARNING : This message originates from the Internet ***

Skylight Media is working towards BS8555 Environmental Standard and we are a 'Carbon Neutral' company supporter. View
our Environmental Policy and please don't print out this email unless you really need to; do your bit to save paper and resources!

PLEASE NOTE
The information contained within this e-mail and its attachments should be considered confidential and therefore prohibited from unauthorised use.
The content and attachments herein are intended solely for the addressee, and access to this e-mail by anyone else is unauthorised. If you are not the
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intended recipient, any reproduction, dissemination, copying, disclosure, modification, distribution and/or publication is prohibited and may be deemed
unlawful. As the Internet's security cannot be guaranteed, Skylight Media will not be held liable for any claims arising as a result of the use of this
medium. The views expressed within this email and/or its attachments are not necessarily those expressed by Skylight Media, and therefore Skylight
Media does not accept responsibility for their content.

Skylight Media Limited. Registered in England & Wales. Registered Number 05192351. Registered Office: 12 Poplars Court. Lenton Lane,
Nottingham. NG7 2RR.
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