
Georgina Martin <georginam@retirement.capital>

February Pension
gehane habib <gehabib12@hotmail.com> Tue, Feb 11, 2025 at 11:16 AM
To: Georgina Martin <georginam@retirement.capital>

Hello Georgina,

Can you please change bank account details for future pension payments to:

Gehan Habib 
HSBC 

Acc: 70074934
SC: 40-18-60

I need £7,000 net in March 2025

Many thanks 

Gina 
Sent from my iPhone

On 10 Feb 2025, at 13:23, gehane habib <gehabib12@hotmail.com> wrote:

﻿ Thank you Georgina 
[Quoted text hidden]
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