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INFOMATRIX ONEVIEW PENSION TRUST - C AMERICANOS

6 messages

Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com>

Charles Georghios Americanos <charles@cgaconsult.uk> 5 April 2021 at 11:27

To: Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com>

Hi Emily

This is notification the CGA Consulting Ltd has made a payment of £2,000 to the above for Tuesday 6 April 2021 Pension Contribution
for INFOMATRIX ONEVIEW PENSION TRUST - C AMERICANOS.

regards

Charles

CGA Consulting Ltd
Marlow UK

Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com> 7 April 2021 at 13:07

To: Charles Georghios Americanos <charles@cgaconsult.uk>
Hi Charles,
Thank you for your email.
The £2k has not arrived into AIB as yet. Can you please confirm the account details it was sent to?
| look forward to hearing from you.

Thanks
Emily
[Quoted text hidden]

Kind Regards

Emily McAlister
Administrator

Please note our new administration and post processing centre:

Pension Practitioner
Office 12

Venture Wales Building
Pentrebach

Merthyr Tydfil

CF48 4DR

T: 0800 634 4862
F: 020 8711 2522

Pension Practitioner is a tradestyle of The Practitioners Partnership LP
Registered Number: 00159
Registered Office: 1st Floor, World Trade Centre, Baytree Road, Gibraltar GX11 1AA

IMPORTANT - PLEASE NOTE The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged
material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of or taking of any action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended
recipient is prohibited. If you received this in error please contact the sender and destroy this email.

Charles Georghios Americanos <charles@cgaconsult.uk> 8 April 2021 at 10:28

To: Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com>

Hi Emily

The £2000 went from our Company Account Santander mandate to

23-05-80 38058942

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2?ik=71218bf627 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1696192117152318413&simpl=msg-f%3A16961921...
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BUSINESS CURRENT ACCOUNT - 09-01-28 70344625

Payment number

105

Payee name

INFOMATRIX ONEV

Their account

23-05-80 38058942

Payment reference

IOPT-C AMERICANOS

Your comments

Pension CA

Hope this helps

Charles

CGA Consulting Ltd
Marlow UK

From: Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com>

Sent: 07 April 2021 12:07

To: Charles Georghios Americanos

Subject: Re: INFOMATRIX ONEVIEW PENSION TRUST - C AMERICANOS

[Quoted text hidden]

Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com> 8 April 2021 at 10:55
To: Charles Georghios Americanos <charles@cgaconsult.uk>

Hi Charles,
Apologies, | thought the transfer had been made to your scheme AIB account. But, this is to your Metro Bank account.
Kind regards

Emily
[Quoted text hidden]

Charles Georghios Americanos <charles@cgaconsult.uk> 21 April 2021 at 14:32
To: Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com>

Emily
Here is details of the £2,000 into Metro Bank.
regards

Charles

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2?ik=71218bf627 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1696192117152318413&simpl=msg-f%3A16961921... 2/3
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ETRO

REGISTERED SCHEME ADMINISTRATOR LTD
Internet Banking

BANK et &

View your Accounts v View your Statements Help
& transactions & other docurnents & Contact Us

g INFOMATRIX ONEVIEW P T-C AMERICANOS Help for this page v

Account number: 38058942 Sort coce: 23-05-80 View more Account details

CURRENT BALANCE AVAILABLE BALANCE LATEST STATEMENTS
£2 - 000 _57 £2.000.57 Download a copy of your
i is? latest statement
What is this? el
Recent Transactions Last 5 transactions
Mongy In : £12,000.57 Maoney Qut : -£10,000.00

Pending Transactions
Search Transactions ¥

Useful Account Services

Date < Details Transaction Type < Moneyin < Moneyout ¢ Balance
06 Apr 2021 CGA COMSULTING LTD Inward Payment 2,000.00 2,000.57
IOPT-C AMERICANOS

CGA Consulting Ltd
Marlow UK

From: Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com>
Sent: 08 April 2021 09:55
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpractitioner.com> 22 April 2021 at 14:46
To: Charles Georghios Americanos <charles@cgaconsult.uk>

Thanks Charles.

Kind regards

Emily
[Quoted text hidden]
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