1/18/2019 PensionPractitioner.com Mail - Fwd: FW: Tulip Research

Brad Davis <bradd@pensionpractitioner.com>

Fwd: FW: Tulip Research

Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com> 17 December 2015 at 23:14
To: Brad Davis <bradd@pensionpractitioner.com>

Kind regards
Georgina

Pension Practitioner .Com
Daws House

33-35 Daws Lane

London

NW7 4SD

T: 0800 634 4862
F: 020 8711 2522

UK Reg Co No: 6028668
VAT Reg No: 894312018
HMRC Practitioner Reg: 00005886

IMPORTANT - PLEASE NOTE The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is
addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other
use of or taking of any action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient
is prohibited. If you received this in error please contact the sender and destroy this email.

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Peter Best <pbest@tag.uk.com>

Date: 17 December 2015 at 17:27

Subject: FW: Tulip Research

To: Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com>

Cc: David Nicklin <davidn@pensionpractitioner.com>, David Thompson <david.thompson@tagwealth.org.uk>, "Sales
@ Matlock Ford" <sales@matlockford.co.uk>, Miranda Waller <Miranda.Waller@aucapital.com>

Hi Georgina

Further to the email below, can you please arrange for the funds to be paid to Digital Media Services from the Matlock
Ford SSAS bank account so that we can complete her Aspiro investment.

If you have any queries please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours sincerely

Peter Best DipPFs Cert CII (Life and Pensions)
Office Manager

TAG Wealth Management

Riverdale, 89 Graham Road, Sheffield S10 3GP

Tel: 0114 263 2423 Fax: 0114 263 2419
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Over the festive period TAG Wealth Management will be closed from 2pm on 23" December until 9am on

Monday 4TH January 2016. May | take this opportunity to wish you a very merry Christmas and a happy and
prosperous new year

The information contained in this Email and any attached files may be confidential and is intended solely for the addressee. Copying, dissemination,
distribution or re-use of the information contained in this Email and any attached files by anyone else is unauthorised. Internet communications are not
secure and therefore TAG Wealth Management does not accept any legal responsibility for the contents of this message. Any views or opinions
presented are those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of TAG Wealth Management. If you are not the intended recipient, all copies of
the Email and any associated files should be destroyed. TAG Wealth Management cannot guarantee that this email remains virus free once sent.

TAG Wealth Management is an appointed representative of Intrinsic Financial Planning Ltd and Intrinsic Mortgage
Planning Ltd, registered in England 5372217, Wiltshire Court, Farnsby Street, Swindon, SN1 5AH. Intrinsic Financial
Services is a holding company, subsidiaries of which are authorised and regulated by the Financial Conduct Authority

Partners: D Thompson MIFS DipFA & A R M Young MIFS DipFA

b% please don’t print this email unless you really need to.

From: Catherine MacEwen [mailto:Catherine@corinthian.gi]

Sent: 17 December 2015 15:03

To: 'Sales @ Matlock Ford' <sales@matlockford.co.uk>; keith@bakerstreet.uk.com

Cc: info@deltaadmin.co.uk; Info DigitalMSL <info@digitalmsl.com>; Peter Best (pbest@tag.uk.com)
<pbest@tag.uk.com>

Subject: **SPAM** RE: Tulip Research

Dear Sirs,

We hereby confirm our agreement to your request to purchase 144,000 shares in Tulip Research Limited at £1.00 per
share.

Please remit £144,000 to our account below:

Bank: Royal Bank of Scotland t/a Natwest, 57/63 Line Wall Road, Gibraltar
Account Name: Digital Media Services Limited

Account Number: 39106488

Sort 60-95-44

Code:

IBAN: Gl14RB0OS060954439106488
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BIC RBOSGIGI
Code:

On receipt of the funds we will execute the share transfer form in your favour.

Yours faithfully,

For and on behalf of Digital Media Services Limited

Catthercne

Catherine MacEwen

Director

Trust Company Limited

186 Main Street, PO Box 453, Gibraltar

Direct: + 350 200 65284

Office: + 350 200 61053

Fax: + 350 200 60953

Spanish Mobile: + 34 680605725

Email: catherine@corinthian.gi
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Wishing everyone a very Happy Christmas and prosperous New Year.

During the festive period our offices will be closed as follows;

12 noon on Thursday 24" December to re-open Monday 4th January.

Licensed by the Gibraltar Financial Services Commission under Licence No. FSC01066B.

This message (plus any attachments, if included) may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged
information and is intended only for the use of the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient of this message
you are hereby notified that you must not use, disseminate, copy it in any form or take any action in reliance upon
it. If you have received this message in error please delete it and any copies of it and advise Corinthian Trust
Company Limited immediately.

Corinthian Trust Company Limited does not provide tax or investment advice. We recommend independent advice
should be taken in all circumstances. Information contained in any email correspondence should not be treated as
advice.

From: Sales @ Matlock Ford [mailto:sales@matlockford.co.uk]

Sent: 17 December 2015 11:17

To: keith@bakerstreet.uk.com

Cc: info@deltaadmin.co.uk; Info DigitalMSL; Peter Best (pbest@tag.uk.com)
Subject: Tulip Research

To the directors of Digital Media Services Limited (DMSL) and Tulip Research Limited (keith@bakerstreet.uk.com,
info@deltaadmin.co.uk , inffo@digitalmsl.com)

We as trustees of Matlock Ford SSAS wish to purchase £144,000.00 of shares in Tulip Research Limited from DMSL
at a price of £1 per share.

Can you please let us know if you are in agreement and please advise us of the next steps. Thank you.
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