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Esther S <esther@pensionpractitioner.com>

Re: Boyd and Lloyd Pension Scheme - please may you sign the outward payment form
1 message

Tia Mahadevan <bocateamwear@icloud.com>
To: Esther S <esther@pensionpractitioner.com>
Cc: Darren Lloyd <darrenlloyd@cliftonrugby.co.uk>, Darren Lloyd <D.Lloyd@united-uk.com>



16/09/2019 PensionPractitioner.com Mail - Re: Boyd and Lloyd Pension Scheme - please may you sign the outward payment form

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=0856b4241d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar6982263201448038365%7Cmsg-f%3A16448356… 2/4



16/09/2019 PensionPractitioner.com Mail - Re: Boyd and Lloyd Pension Scheme - please may you sign the outward payment form

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=0856b4241d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar6982263201448038365%7Cmsg-f%3A16448356… 3/4

Rob Boyd*,Boca Teamwear Ltd
07768238452

On 16 Sep 2019, at 09:31, Esther S <esther@pensionpractitioner.com> wrote:

Dear Darren and Rob,

I hope you are both well.

Please may I trouble you to sign the attached payment form for the RAE Commercial Invoice, and pop it back via email.  I will then make the payment.

Many thanks for your help.

Kind Regards

Esther Salmon
Administrator

Please note our new administration and post processing centre:

Pension Practitioner
Office 12
Venture Wales Building
Pentrebach
Merthyr Tydfil 
CF48 4DR

T:  0800 634 4862 

mailto:esther@pensionpractitioner.com
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F:  020 8711 2522

Pension Practitioner is a tradestyle of The Practitioners Partnership LP
Registered Number: 00159
Registered Office: 1st Floor, World Trade Centre, Baytree Road, Gibraltar GX11 1AA

IMPORTANT - PLEASE NOTE The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. A

<AIB OPI - RAE Commercial £352.81 - 13.09.19.pdf>

<BOYD AND LLOYD - RAE Commercial invoice.pdf>


