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URGENT Re: SavEnt Ltd Executive Pension Scheme

Sue Savage <savage.sue@icloud.com> 18 March 2021 at 13:25
To: Stacy Lunnon <stacyl@retirement.capital>

Hi Stacey,

Rowanmoor are an absolute shambles and why | moved away from them! We might need to get

’shirty’ with them again, like we did when they took so long with transferring the Metro funds -

happy to get involved if you want me to contact them too ...

Please find attached the signed forms - I'm surprised Dawn didn’t mention my intention to ‘retire’ /

draw my tax free cash at age 55, when she was dealing with the transfer to you from Rowanmoor
?

Many thanks,

Sue

e Bank Account for funds (Nationwide): 07-16-60 / 56195897 - Susan Savage

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/3?ik=b48f2b3c3b&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1694572558390345220&simpl=msg-f%3A16945725583...  1/5



3/18/2021 Retirement.Capital Mail - URGENT Re: SavEnt Ltd Executive Pension Scheme

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/3?ik=b48f2b3c3b&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1694572558390345220&simpl=msg-f%3A16945725583...  3/5




3/18/2021 Retirement.Capital Mail - URGENT Re: SavEnt Ltd Executive Pension Scheme

Desatuce. SN
18/03/2021
.'..-:-_-d.ﬂﬂ

On 18 Mar 2021, at 11:57, Stacy Lunnon <stacyl@retirement.capital> wrote:

Hi Sue,

| am looking into your investments and trying to find out the current status. Please
bear with me on that.

Rowanmoor have been very dismissive, | am chasing the two issues, 1. the invoice
that they have raised, and 2. the payment into the Metro Bank account instead of
into the new pension scheme account.

We have drafted a Benefit Crystallisation Event form and a Lifetime Allowance
Certificate for you so that you can draw the tax free cash. Can you please sign both
pages and email them back to me. Please provide me with your personal bank
account details, i.e. name on account, sort code and account number and we will
make the payment to you as soon as we receive the signed forms.

Kind Regards,
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