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nn
Re: Singleton Engineering Pension Scheme

Vikki Whitby <vikki@retirement.capital> 3 December 2021 at 10:57
To: Roger Bloomer <roger@rogercbloomer.co.uk>

Cc: "DuncanS@singletoneng.com" <DuncanS@singletoneng.com>, Emily McAlister <emily@retirement.capital>,
Veronica Walkman <veronica@retirement.capital>, Tony McCartney <tonym@sretirement.capital>

Hello Roger,
Thank you very much for this information.

Veronica/Tony,
| think this is the last requirement for the tax return now, please see Rogers email below, thanks.

Kind Regards
Vikki Whitby
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Any statement or advice given in this email or any other correspondence by Retirement Capital, its employees or consultants on any subject not covered
by a signed terms of engagement is given without liability for any advice or mis-statement. This E-mail and any attachments to it are strictly confidential
and intended solely for the addressee. It and they may contain information which is covered by professional or other privilege. If you are not the intended

addressee, you must not disclose, forward, copy or take any action in reliance on this email or its attachments. If you have received this email in error,
please notify the sender at data@retirement.capital as soon as possible and delete this email immediately and destroy any hard copies of it.

On Thu, 2 Dec 2021 at 09:12, Roger Bloomer <roger@rogercbloomer.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Vikki

The split is Eden site £60980.61, Blacknell Lane main site £108657 and Wayleave £18.56.

With best wishes.
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Roger
R C Bloomer FCA, Director

My normal working days are Monday to Thursday

This email is confidential and may be privileged. It may be read, copied and used only by the intended recipient.
If you have received it in error, please contact the sender immediately by return email or by telephoning 01793
421007. Please then delete the email and do not disclose it to any person.

Roger C Bloomer
Chartered Accountants
2 Charnwood Court
Newport Street
Swindon

SN1 3DX

Tel 01793 421007 www.rogercbloomer.co.uk

Roger C Bloomer is the trading name of Accountax Services (Swindon) Limited, a company registered in England
and Wales, company number 2805024.

From: Vikki Whitby <vikki@retirement.capital>

Sent: 26 November 2021 10:52

To: Roger Bloomer <roger@rogercbloomer.co.uk>; DuncanS@singletoneng.com
Cc: Emily McAlister <emily@retirement.capital>

Subject: Fwd: Singleton Engineering Pension Scheme

Hello Roger

Thank you for sending in the accounts. Please can we ask you to send a breakdown of the rental income
between the two properties?

Many thanks

Kind Regards
Vikki Whitby
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Data Processing Centre
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Any statement or advice given in this email or any other correspondence by Retirement Capital, its employees or
consultants on any subject not covered by a signed terms of engagement is given without liability for any advice
or mis-statement. This E-mail and any attachments to it are strictly confidential and intended solely for the
addressee. It and they may contain information which is covered by professional or other privilege. If you are not
the intended addressee, you must not disclose, forward, copy or take any action in reliance on this email or its
attachments. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender at data@retirement.capital as
soon as possible and delete this email immediately and destroy any hard copies of it.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Gavin <gavinm@pensionpractitioner.com>
Date: Fri, 26 Nov 2021 at 10:42

Subject: Fwd: Singleton Engineering Pension Scheme
To: <vikki@retirement.capital>

Pension Practitioner

T: 0800 634 4862
F: 020 8906 6611

Administration Centre: Venture Wales, Pentrebach. Merthyr Tydfil. CF48 4DR
Pension Practitioner is a tradestyle of The Practitioners Partnership LP

Registered Number: 00159

Registered Office: 1st Floor, World Trade Centre, Baytree Road, Gibraltar GX11 1AA
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IMPORTANT - PLEASE NOTE The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is
addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other
use of or taking of any action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient
is prohibited. If you received this in error please contact the sender and destroy this email.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Roger Bloomer <roger@rogercbloomer.co.uk>

Date: Mon, 23 Aug 2021 at 16:41

Subject: Singleton Engineering Pension Scheme

To: Gavin (gavinm@pensionpractitioner.com) <gavinm@pensionpractitioner.com>
Cc: Duncan Singleton (DuncanS@singletoneng.com) <DuncanS@singletoneng.com>

Hi Gavin
| hope you are well?
The trustees have approved the 2021 accounts and a copy is attached.

| also attach the draft funds split which is on the basis that Ollie’s apportionment is backdated to the start of the
year as agreed by the Trustees and him as member.

The documents are password protected and a separate email has been sent regarding this.
If you need any further information to complete returns, or provide information to the trustees, please let me know.

With best wishes.

Roger
R C Bloomer FCA, Director

My normal working days are Monday to Thursday

This email is confidential and may be privileged. It may be read, copied and used only by the intended recipient.
If you have received it in error, please contact the sender immediately by return email or by telephoning 01793
421007. Please then delete the email and do not disclose it to any person.

Roger C Bloomer

Chartered Accountants
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2 Charnwood Court

Newport Street
Swindon
SN1 3DX

Tel 01793 421007 www.rogercbloomer.co.uk

Roger C Bloomer is the trading name of Accountax Services (Swindon) Limited, a company registered in England
and Wales, company number 2805024.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=0b0c6c38d4 &view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A171811475642039544 7 &simpl=msg-f%3A1718114... 5/5


http://www.rogercbloomer.co.uk/

