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RE: Queries on account
From: Andrew Coveney
To: Sue Tierney
Cc: Emily McAlister
Sent: 3/8/2023 6:03:46 PM

Attachments: acctEfigs.pdf

Hello Sue

Very well indeed thank you - how are you?

I was doing the Tokyo Marathon on Sunday and just back yesterday evening.

I think I've found the issue which was the same payment of £142.80 rejected several times as the old account was closed. It then went through at last to your 
new account.

If you could have a look at the attached Sue which covers the above and then we can speak again? I have copied Emily in so that she is aware of our discussion 
on this matter.

With best wishes,

Andrew 

Andrew Coveney | Investment Manager
Chartered Wealth Manager
Chartered Financial Planner
Fellow of the Personal Finance Society
T +44 (0)203 393 6524
M +44 (0)7714 856877
Email andrew.coveney@equerry-im.co.uk

-----Original Message-----
From: Sue Tierney <suetierney@live.co.uk> 
Sent: 07 March 2023 19:26
To: Andrew Coveney <Andrew.Coveney@equerry-im.co.uk>
Subject: Queries on account 

Hi Andrew, hope you’re well? I sent a query on the account to Emily and she mentioned she had forwarded it to you…have you had a chance to have a look at it?
Many thanks Sue

Sent from my iPhone


