WEVE GOT YOU COVERED

07850920222

Invoice To: ’ Deliver To: -
Nick i Nick
Mr N Wisdom i Mr N Wisdom
Wisdom Sports . Wisdom Sports
13 South Road i 13 South Road
Haywards Heath | Haywards Heath
West Sussex | West Sussex
RH16 4LE RH16 4LE

Invoice Date Due Date Reference

16/08/2024 19/08/2024 Wisdom Sports

Description Qty/Hrs Price/Rate

To complete flat roof replatement as in our quotation dated 24/01/2024
To complete additional works as agreed

VAT Rate Net VAT
Standard 20.00% (20.00%) £5,430.00 £1,086.00
Notes:

Payment details:
Payse Name: C.H Roofing Limited

Sort code: 30-99-50
Account number: 44539063

Registered in England and Wales No. 10572548 , VAT Registration Number GB 442303533
Registered Address 84 Manor Road, Lancing, West Sussex, BN15 0HD

Many thanks

Connor Hobby
C.H Roofing Limited

1.00 3,680.00
1.00 1,750.00

Total Net
Total VAT
TOTAL

C.H Roofing Limited

2 Caterways
Horsham, RH12 2AL
United Kingdom

Email connor_hobby1@yahoo.co.uk

SALES INVOICE

Invoice Number
Si-349
VAT % Net

20.00 3,680.00
20.00 1,750.00

5,430.00
1,086.00
£6,516.00
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Door

From: Michael Pilmoor (michaelpilmoor203@outlook.com)
Te:  nicwis@aol.com

Date: Friday, 14 June 2024 at 09:37 BST

For your security, we have disabled links in this email. If you believe it is safe to use, mark this message as
not spam.

Take door off remove old door frame

Supply and fit new hard wood frame

Rehung door chopped hinges and keep into new frame
Labour and materials £500.00

Thanks mick

Mick Pilmoor

General Building and Decorating

Tel - 0788688407
Mail - mick.pilmoor@ggoglemail.com
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Fw: Door and frame nicvis@ackcom/inbox

{ n’ 10 Jan 2t 18:42

Print . Raw message
Inter Sport | Sales Manager <office@gameforii
fe.co.uk>
To: nicwis@aal.com <nicwis@aol.coms
Hi Nick,
The upstairs door replacement invoice in below email.

Many thanks,

Richard Harding
Intersport Lewes/Seaford & Wisdom Sports

01273475235 01444451370

- WaEM

vurwom  VINTERSPORT

From: Michael Pllmoor <michaelpilmoor203@outiook.com>
Sent: 10 June 2024 18:36

To: inter Sport | Sales Manager

Subject: Door and frame

10/06/2024

Take off doar take out old door frame

Supply new hardwood frame and fit

Supplied new fixings

Rehung existing doar cut fiew fock in to frame
Labour and materials £500.00

Bank detalls

Sort code 11 15 37 account 00055213

Thank mick

Mick Pilmoor
General Building and Decorating

Tal - 0788688407
Mail - michaelpitmoor203@outlook.com
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