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Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com>

Fwd: Instruction to pay funds

David Nicklin <davidn@pensionpractitioner.com> 17 March 2019 at 20:43
To: Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com>, William Voegt <wvoegt@gmail.com>, Tony
McCartney <tonym@pensionpractitioner.com>

Morning Gina,

Could you, please authorise this payment as soon as you can and can it go the quickest route.
Please see authorisation from the trustee

Dave

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: David Nicklin <davidn@pensionpractitioner.com>
Date: Sun, 17 Mar 2019 at 12:05

Subject: Instruction to pay funds

To: <ian@thameside.tv>, William Voegt <wvoegt@gmail.com>

Hi lan,
| just need you to instruct me by email to make the payment of £80,000
The sending bank details are

Bank Name: Allied Irish Bank (GB)

Account Name: ZICO OTS Ltd Pension Scheme
Account Number: 04919088

Sort Code: 23-83-96

The receiving bank details are ( William can you double check these details to avoid any last minute errors)

Bank Name: Starling Bank

Account Name: Associated Trading Ltd
Account Number: 15407811

Sort Code: 60-83-71

Kind Regards

David
David Nicklin

Pension Practitioner
Office 12

Venture Wales Building
Pentrebach

Merthyr Tydfil

CF48 4DR

M: 07535010480
T: 0800 634 4862
F: 020 8906 6611

Pension Practitioner is a tradestyle of The Practitioners Partnership LP
Registered Number: 00159
Registered Office: 1st Floor, World Trade Centre, Baytree Road, Gibraltar GX11 1AA

IMPORTANT - PLEASE NOTE The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is
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Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com>

Fwd: Instruction to pay funds

David Nicklin <davidn@pensionpractitioner.com>
To: Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com>

Hi Gina,

Please find confirmation below

Apologies | can't go back and ask him to sign the mandate as he is not around today.

Long story but this was supposed to happen Friday
Dave

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: ian@thameside.tv <ian@thameside.tv>
Date: Sun, 17 Mar 2019 at 13:30

Subject: Re: Instruction to pay funds

To: David Nicklin <davidn@pensionpractitioner.com>

Hi David,

Please accept this as my authority to transfer the funds as below.

I can confirm that the Starling Bank details are as William gave me.

Kind Regards,

Ian Gough

Thameside.tv

Tel +44 (0) 1932 240204

Mob. +44 (0) 7785 256652

www.thameside.tv <http://www.thameside.tv>
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