FAC : Emily MR isler

Pension

INVOICE

Bill To

THC Ltd Pension Scheme
The Henley Consultancy Limited
22 Millstream Close

Andover

Hampshire

SP10 2NB

ltem & Description

LEl Renewal

Annual LEl renewal fee

Thank you for using our services.

Terms & Conditions

Payment tc be made on receipt of invoice

BACS:
Barclays Bank Plc
Account Name: The Practitioners Partnership

Sort Code; 20-45-45
Account Number: 23784606

Pension Practitioner is a trade style of The Practitioners Partnership LP

Pension Practitioner

Office 12

Venture Wales Building

Pentrebach Merthyr Tydfil CF48 4DR
United Kingdom

Invoice# INV-7730
Invoice Date 13 Feb 2020
Terms Due on Receipt
Due Date 13 Feb 2020
Qty Amount
1 65.00
Sub Total 65.00
Totai : £65.00
Balance Due £65.00

UK Address: Office 12, Venture Wales Building, Pentrebach, Merthyr Tydfil CF48 4DR, United Kingdom

Registered Address: 1st Floor, World Trade Centre, Gibraltar. GX11 1AA
Registered in Gibraltar at Companies House Na: 159

COPY



From: Emily McAlister emilym@pensionpractitioner.com @
Subject: Re: THC Ltd Pension Scheme - LEI
Date: 13 February 2020 at 13:39
To: Andrew Henley TheHenleyConsultancyl td @hotmail.com

Hi Andrew,
I'am pleased to confirm your LEI renewal is now complete, please see the details below.

LEI: 213800A4FW2ZY4J1.8109
Official Entity Name: THC LTD PENSION SCHEME
Annual Renewal Date: 13/02/2021

Please see the attached invoice, can | ask that you arrange payment of this please?

Thanks
Emily

On Wed, 12 Feb 2020 at 21:42, Andrew Heniey <TheHenleyConsultancyltd @hot
Hello Emily, thank you for your email. Yes please Emily.

0> wrote:

Thanks
Andy

i Kind regards

Andrew Henley

Mobile No: 0787 949 0741
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On 12 Feb 2020, at 10:19, Emily McAlister <emilym@pensionpragitioner.com> wrote:

Dear Andrew,
I hope that you are well.

I have been informed that your LEI is now due for renewal. The cost for this is £65.00 - would you like me to arrange this
for you?

I look forward to hearing from you.
Thanks
Kind Regards

Emily McAlister
Adminisfrator

Please note our new administration and post processing centre: (g @ PY




Pension Practitioner
Office 12

Venture Wales Building
Pentrebach

Merthyr Tydfil

CF48 4DR

T: 0800 634 4862
F: 020 8711 2522

Pension Practitioner is a tradestyle of The Practitioners Partnership LP
Registered Number: 00159
Registered Office: 1st Floor, World Trade Centre, Baytree Road, Gibraltar GX11 1AA

IMPORTANT - PLEASE NOTE The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it Is addressed
and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of or taking
of any action in reliance upan this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you
received this in error please contact the sender and destroy this email.

Kind Regards

Emily McAlister
Administrator

Please note our new administration and post processing centre:

Pension Practitioner
Office 12

Venture Wales Building
Pentrebach

Merthyr Tydfil

CF48 4DR

T: 0800 634 4862

F: 020 8711 2522

Pension Practitioner is a tradestyle of The Praciitioners Parinership LP

Registered Number: 00159

Registered Office: 1st Floor, World Trade Centre, Bayiree Road, Gibraltar GX11 1AA

IMPORTANT - PLEASE NOTE The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and
may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, refransmission, dissemination or other use of or taking of any

action in reliance upon this information by persons or eniities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this in
error please contact the sender and destroy this email.
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CUSTOMER COPY
BARCLAYS BANK UK PLC

BRANCH 20-56-56 41
pudit Sequence Number: 0034
MERTHYR TYOFIL

20-45-45
x4x*4600

ISN SERTAL\NARR AMOUNT
1980781824  A1MERTHYR TYDFIL 65.00

TIMED AT 10:23 ON 24/02/2020

CASH DEPOSITED GBP 0.00
CHEQUES DEPOSITED GBP £5.00
ISN SERTAL AMOUNT
1980281825 000006 GBP 65.00
OTHER DEPOSITS GBP 0.00
TOTAL DEPOSITED GBP 65.00

Cheques deposited today will be
available for withdrawal in tuwo days
(excluding weekends and Bank Holidays).
For example, chegues deposited on a
Monday would be available for withdrawal
on the following Wednesday. For details
of how cheques clear, including
information on when cheques can be
returned unpaid, search for Zcheque
clearing cycle? at www .barclays.co.uk

please do not litter




