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Esther Salmon <esther@retirement.capital>

ia ‘QU

Re: RC Administration Ltd - Company Tax Return

1 message

Ross Macleod <ross.macleod@mycloud9accounting.co.uk> 18 March 2021 at 15:55
To: Jen Crawford <jen@davenicklin.com>

Cc: David Nicklin <davidn@retirement.capital>, Gavin <gavinm@retirement.capital>, Esther <esther@retirement.capital>

Hi Jen

Its £400 exc VAT for the Accounts and CT to be filed. This is the price | charge for Dormant Co accounts (well nearly
dormant in this case). Please can you provide me with the Companies House Filing Code too.

Regards

On Thu, 11 Mar 2021 at 15:50, Jen Crawford <jen@davenicklin.com> wrote:

Hi Ross,

As discussed please find attached HMRC Notice and UTR for the above company for which Dave is a Director.

The Company needs to show a small amount of income (£7,500) for the tax year to show it is trading, RC
Administration Ltd will raise an invoice for this amount to the Practitioner Partnership LLP which Dave will arrange.

Please can you advise cost for completing this as a one off project.

Many thanks

Jen

Jenni Crawford

On behalf of David Nicklin

Regards

Ross Macleod ACA
Director

Mycloud9Accounting Limited
Reg No 09009359 ENW

3 Hunters Mews, Oakfield, Sale, M33 6WA.
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The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any
action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you
received this in error, please contact the sender at The Institute of Chartered Accountants in England and Wales,
Chartered Accountants' Hall, Moorgate Place, London, EC2R 6EA or by using the reply option to this e-mail, and
delete the material from any computer.
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